
 

VENANGO COUNTY TAX CLAIM BUREAU 

2014 JUDICIAL SALE RESULTS 

SALE DATE: April 14, 2014 

Venango County Courthouse Annex 

Conference Room 100 at 10:00 AM  
 

 

CANAL TWP 
 

STULL, GARY L     02,002.-055B.-000 1.55 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  MARVIN A. KUHNS     $ 1,100.00    

        

CHERRYTREE TWP 
 

BILTZ, ARTHUR F     03,010.-001..-000  .33 ACRES    

         NO BID 

    

MATTHEWS, CARL E     03,014.-003..-000  .22 ACRES    

         NO BID 

             

TROUP, DAVID B SR     03,019.-009..-000  .75 ACRES, IMP    

         NO BID 

             

TURNER, T      03,007.-002..-001  MOBILEHOME    

         NO BID 

            

CLINTON TWP 
 

MURPHY, LARRY & KIMBERLY   04,004.-003A.-000 2.00 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  MARVIN A. KUHNS     $ 4,250.00  

     

CORNPLANTER TWP 

 
HOGUE, MELISSA     07,006.-021..-046  MOBILEHOME   

         NO BID 

 

JUHI INC      07,015.-061..-000  .96 ACRES    

 SOLD:  MARVIN A. KUHNS     $ 600.00      
             

SHOOK, KEITH E SR     07,018.-009..-000  .09 ACRES    

         NO BID 

           

CRANBERRY TWP 
 

BROWN, DALE A & VANESSA A   08,006.-045..-014  IMP W/O LAND    

         NO BID 

 

HEPLER, WALLACE D JR & BETTY J  08,045.-025..-000  6.14 ACRES, IMP 

         NO BID 

 

JORINSCAY, WILLIAM & LISA    08,042.-034..-000  .15 ACRES, IMP    

         NO BID 

             

SCHULTZ, YETTA     08,043.-044A.-000,  .08 ACRES    

         NO BID 
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SIMMONS, CLYDE     08,043.-044..-000  .08 ACRES   

         NO BID 

            

SUTHERLAND, KENNETH D    08,043.-005..-000  .30 ACRES, IMP   

         NO BID 

            

SUTHERLAND, KENNETH D    08,043.-052..-000  .10 ACRES   

         NO BID 

            

EMLENTON BORO 
 

ROBERTS, WILLIE G JR    09,004.-042..-000  .15 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  TIMOTHY S. & KATHRYN L. KRIEBEL  $ 600.00     

      

SCHIBERL, BRION & BARBARA   09,006.-030..-000  .50 ACRES, IMP    

 SOLD:  DARRYL D. EVERETT     $ 700.00     

   

SHEFFER, PATRICK B & MELINDA S   09,002.-078..-000  .14 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  DARRYL D. EVERETT     $  1,100.00    

             

WIKE, WILLIAM W III & LISA A   09,004.-031..-000  .85 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:   DARRYL D. EVERETT  JR.    $  3,700.00    
          

FRANKLIN 
 

BARNEY, DALE L & DEBRA A    10,220.-045..-000  717 15TH STREET, .19 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  STEPHEN C. BEALS     $ 7,500.00 

 

BARNEY, DALE L & DEBRA A    10,220.-044..-000  715 15TH STREET, .19 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  STEPHEN C. BEALS     $ 7,500.00 

          

BEATTY, RITA L     10,331.-037..-000  229 GRANT STREET, .25 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  RICHARD S. BONAMICO    $ 5,250.00    

       

CARDY, HOLLY L     10,110.-104..-000  1036 BUFFALO STREET, .08 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD:  JAMES L. HARRAH & TOD A. LATCHAW  $ 16,000.00    

             

ESTATE OF ANNA MYERS   10,111.-079..-000  11TH ST EXT, 2.20 ACRES 

         NO BID 

 

GIBBONS, CHARLES R & STACY L   10,347.-225D.-000 93 WASHINGTON ST, .19 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  JAMES L. HARRAH & TOD A. LATCHAW  $ 28,000.00    

             

HOLLAND, CARY & GRACE    10,102.-002..-000  533 THIRD STREET, .17 ACRES, IMP   

         NO BID 

            

HOLLAND, CARY & GRACE M    10,221.-012..-000  826 15TH STREET EXT, .82 ACRES  

         NO BID 

  

PASSIOTTI, JOSH     10,102.-015..-000  529 1/2 3RD STREET, .17 ACRES, IMP   

         NO BID 

 

SCOTT, SAMUEL J & THELMA C   10,221.-013..-000  832 15TH STREET, .13 ACRES    

         NO BID 

 

FRENCHCREEK TWP 
 

ADAMS, PEARL     11,019.-006..-001  MOBILEHOME    

         NO BID 
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JACKSON TWP 
 

KILGORE, ROBERT &    13,006.-002J.-025 MOBILEHOME    

 GEORGE, EILEEN      NO BID 

 

SNYDER, LAURIE BERNICE    13,001.-029C.-006 MOBILEHOME    

         NO BID 

 

OIL CITY 
 

ABPLANALP, ROBERT L & DOROTHY R 16,028.-193..-000  317 WEST FIFTH STREET, .09 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD:  MARVIN L. NORCROSS    $ 900.00 

     

BLACK, ROSE M     16,048.-153..-000  116 PLUMMER ST, .07 ACRES  

         NO BID 

 

BLACK, ROSE MARIE     16,017.-206..-000  317 E 5TH ALY, .10 ACRES   

         NO BID 

 

BRYAN, TWILA M & E THOMAS F   16,026.-053..-000  11 W EIGHTH STREET, .11 ACRES  

         NO BID 

 

BUNNELL, LEIGH ANN    16,050.-003..-000  10 MANNING STREET, .04 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  FRANCIS DEVIZIA     $ 1,000.00 

 

CHRISTO, STEPHEN P & KRIS    16,040.-267..-000  309 WASHINGTON AVE, .14 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD:  FRANCIS DEVIZIA     $ 600.00 

 

DEETER, ANTHONY L     16,080.-016..-000  LEWIS STREET, .23 ACRES    

         NO BID 

 

GILL, JOSEPH J & IRENE    16,046.-156..-000  117 CLEARFIELD ST, .10 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  MICHAEL & TAMBRA EISMONT   $ 600.00 

 

HALE, LEILA      16,048.-015..-000  7 CLARION ST, .10 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  CHRIS C. & BELINDA L. SNYDER   $ 600.00 

 

HARP, MAE G & JUNE L PERRY   16,038.-212..-000  85 GROVE AVE, .11 ACRES, IMP   

         NO BID 

 

HASKINS, RODNEY J     16,006.-074..-000  314 1/2 RR E FOURTH ST, .06 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD:  WILLIAM D. KAUFMANN    $ 600.00 

 

HASKINS, RODNEY J     16,006.-076..-000  312 1/2 E FOURTH STREET, .06 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD:  WILLIAM D. KAUFMANN    $ 600.00 

    

HOGUE, DANIEL L     16,010.-248..-000  507 W FRONT STREET, .07 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD: CURTIS M. WRAY     $ 2,000.00 

 

JAMES, JASON MICHAEL &    16,034.-170..-000  91 SPRUCE ST, .06 ACRES, IMP,   

 BRANDI NICOLE SIGLER     CONDEMNED  

         NO BID 

        

JOLLEY, DELBERT LEROY & BETTY L   16,010.-165..-000  51 MORAN STREET, .05 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD: CURTIS M. WRAY     $ 5,200.00 

 

LEPLEY, WILLIAM C & NELLIE E   16,010.-211..-000  610 NORTH STREET, .07 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD: CURTIS M. WRAY     $ 1,100.00 
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LOGSDON, VADIS E     16,050.-162..-000  113 CRAWFORD ST, .10 ACRES, IMP,  

         CONDEMNED, SCHEDULED FOR DEMO  

         NO BID 

 

MCLAUGHLIN, RONALD E    16,020.-037..-000  17 W FIFTH STREET, .11 ACRES  

         NO BID 

 

MILLER, JOHN K II & MARY M MCDONOUGH 16,037.-084..-000  23 HARRIOTT AVE, .16 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  WILLIAM D. KAUFMANN    $ 600.00 

         

PETTITE, WILLIAM C     16,026.-200..-000  608 CENTRAL AVENUE, .04 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD: CURTIS M. WRAY     $ 600.00 

            

PETTITE, WILLIAM C     16,026.-199..-000  CENTRAL AVENUE.04 ACRES    

 SOLD: CURTIS M. WRAY     $ 600.00 

            

POMPEO, FRANK A &    16,080.-081..-000  111 CHARLTON STREET, .09 ACRES, IMP  

 PAMELA Z CRONKHITE         

 D/B/A POMPEO PROPERTIES         

 SOLD: NANCY PERRY & THOMAS DAVID PERRY  $ 1,300.00 

 

POMPEO, FRANK A &    16,080.-083..-000  CHARLTON STREET, .18 ACRES  

 PAMELA Z CRONKHITE        

 D/B/A POMPEO PROPERTIES         

 SOLD: NANCY PERRY & THOMAS DAVID PERRY  $ 600.00 

 

RAY, SCOTT A      16,022.-070..-000  317 W FOURTH STREET, .13 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD:  MARVIN L. NORCROSS    $ 17,000.00 

            

RETZER, DOROTHY ANTHONY,   16,020.-035..-000  13 W FIFTH STREET, .10 ACRES  

 TERRY L ANTHONY &          

 DOUGLAS W RETZER 

 SOLD:  DAVID J. & JOYCE A. REED    $ 600.00 

 

SHAWGO, JOSH     16,046.-246..-000  115 EMERALD ST, .10 ACRES, IMP   

         NO BID 

            

SHOEMAKER FAMILY PARTNERS OF   16,040.-066..-000  234 HONE AVENUE, .16 ACRES, IMP   

 MISSISSIPPI LP          

 SOLD:  ROOTO PLUMBING INC    $ 4,750.00 

 

POLK BORO 
 

HOFFMAN, MELINDA S & KEVIN DONNELL 21,003.-020..-000  .19 ACRES, IMP   

         NO BID 

      

PRESIDENT TWP 
 

HARGENRADER, WILLIAM L & ANGELA K 22,005.-081..-000  .40 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  JAMES K. MARSHALL, ELIZABETH M. FISH & $ 31,000.00 

  CHRISTINE K. MARSHALL     

       

 

ROCKLAND TWP 
 

BOHR, EDWARD G     24,020.-022B.-000 .25 ACRES    

         NO BID 

 

DAUGHERTY, JOSEPH W    24,001B-023..-000 .37 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  MARK E. GODA     $ 25,000.00 
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DAUGHERTY, JOSEPH W    24,001B-026..-000 .37 ACRES, IMP    

 SOLD:  MARK E. GODA     $ 7,000.00 

 

FERTIG, FRANK & JULIA KEVERLINE  24,015.-015..-001  MOBILEHOME    

         NO BID 

 

ROUSEVILLE BORO 
 

HECKATHORN, WILBERT D & YELMA J 25,003.-112..-000  .44 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  CLIPBOARD PROPERTIES LLC   $ 6,500.00    

     

HEETER, JOSEPH L & LAVONTA M   25,003.-154..-000  .20 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  JULIANNA SCHWIMMER    $ 2,300.00 

 

HITES, ANDREW D.    25,003.-095..-000  .23 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD:  FRANCIS DEVIZIA     $ 600.00 

 

MOORE, JOHN T     25,003.-113..-000  .46 ACRES, IMP   

         NO BID 

 

SUGARCREEK BORO 
 

JUHI INC      28,014.-055..-000  .75 ACRES    

         NO BID 

            

POMPEO, FRANK A &    28,009.-010..-000  1.02 ACRES    

 PAMELA Z CRONKHITE        

 SOLD:  JOSH BEIGHTOL     $ 1,300.00 

 

TURNER, PATRICIA E     28,011.-229..-000  .09 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD:  JOSH BEIGHTOL     $ 600.00 

            

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


