VENANGO COUNTY TAX CLAIM BUREAU
2013 UPSET TAX SALE RESULTS

FOR 2011 OR PRIOR TAXES
SALE DATE: SEPTEMBER 09, 2013
10:00 A.M. in the Venango County Courthouse Annex, Room 100

LAST UPDATED September 9, 2013

The properties offered for sale are as follows: OWNER OR REPUTED OWNERS, PARCEL NUMBER,
DESCRIPTION, UPSET SALE PRICE.

CANAL TWP
STULL, GARY L 02,002.-055B.-000 1.55 ACRES, IMP $3,784.48
NO BID
CHERRYTREE TWP
BILTZ, ARTHURF 03,010.-001..-000 .33 ACRES $590.88
NO BID
JUHI INC 03,018.-015..-000 .51 ACRES $460.18
SOLD: $460.18
CHERRYTREE UNITED
METHODIST CHURCH
MATTHEWS, CARL E 03,014.-003..-000 .22 ACRES $510.06
NO BID
TROUP, DAVID B SR 03,019.-009..-000 .75 ACRES, IMP $1,551.58
NO BID
TURNER, T 03,007.-002..-001 MOBILEHOME $801.38
NO BID
CLINTON TWP
MAHOOD, BETTY & EDWARD 04,009.-021A.-000 .53 ACRES, IMP $2,167.87
SOLD: $2,167.87
PERRY PROPERTIES, INC
MURPHY, LARRY & KIMBERLY 04,004.-003A.-000 2.00 ACRES, IMP $1,669.52
NO BID
CLINTONVILLE BORO
FITZGERALD, TODD A & BABETTE L 05,002.-022..-000 .15 ACRES, IMP $4,280.04
NO BID
COOPERSTOWN BORO
MILLER, AUDREY JANE 06,004.-005..-000 .74 ACRES, IMP $2,515.88

SOLD: $4,100.00
JOEY ENGEL



HOGUE, MELISSA

JUHI INC

RICE, JESSE & SUSAN

SHOOK, KEITH E SR

SUTHERLAND, KENNETH D

BIGLEY, FRED JR

BROWN, DALE A & VANESSA A

DAUGHERTY, SCOTT D

JORINSCAY, WILLIAM & LISA

PORATH, DONALD J

SCHULTZ, YETTA

SIMMONS, CLYDE

SUTHERLAND, KENNETH D

SUTHERLAND, KENNETH D

ROBERTS, WILLIE G JR

SCHIBERL, BRION & BARBARA

SHEFFER, PATRICK B & MELINDA S

CORNPLANTER TWP

07,006.-021..-046 MOBILEHOME
07,015.-061..-000 .96 ACRES
07,015.-046..-000 41 ACRES, IMP
07,018.-009..-000 .09 ACRES
07,023.-038..-000 .61 ACRES, IMP
CRANBERRY TWP

08,001.-045..-038 MOBILEHOME
08,006.-045..-014 IMP W/O LAND
08,031.-002..-000 .13 ACRES, IMP
08,042.-034..-000 .15 ACRES, IMP
08,015.-010E.-003 MOBILEHOME
08,043.-044A.-000, .08 ACRES
08,043.-044..-000 .08 ACRES
08,043.-005..-000 .30 ACRES, IMP
08,043.-052..-000 .10 ACRES

EMLENTON BORO

09,004.-042..-000

09,006.-030..-000

09,002.-078..-000

.15 ACRES, IMP

.50 ACRES, IMP

.14 ACRES, IMP

$571.72
NO BID

$452.13
NO BID

$5,566.38
NO BID

$489.89
NO BID

$3,628.45
SOLD: $3,628.45

PERRY PROPERTIES, INC

$382.41
NO BID

$451.33
NO BID

$2,106.43
NO BID

$3,212.76
NO BID

$411.62
NO BID

$1,264.05
NO BID

$1,064.05
NO BID

$2,388.74
NO BID

$466.77
NO BID

$855.55
NO BID

$2,448.26
NO BID

$3,242.32
NO BID



WIKE, WILLIAM W 111 & LISA A

WOLFE, DENNIE M & TINA

BARNEY, DALE L & DEBRA A

BARNEY, DALE L & DEBRA A

BEATTY,RITAL

CARDY, HOLLY L

GIBBONS, CHARLES R & STACY L

HOLLAND, CARY & GRACE

HOLLAND, CARY & GRACE M

ESTATE OF ANNA MYERS

PASSIOTTI, JOSH

SCOTT, SAMUEL J & THELMA C

WIMER, PATRICIA M

ADAMS, PEARL

KINLEY OIL & GAS CORP

KILGORE, ROBERT &
GEORGE, EILEEN

PLYMIRE, LAWRENCE G & SHEILA D

09,004.-031..-000 .85 ACRES, IMP
09,001.-024..-000 .14 ACRES, IMP
FRANKLIN
10,220.-044..-000 .19 ACRES, IMP
10,220.-045..-000 .19 ACRES, IMP
10,331.-037..-000 .25 ACRES, IMP
10,110.-104..-000 .08 ACRES, IMP
10,347.-225D.-000 .19 ACRES, IMP
10,102.-002..-000 .17 ACRES, IMP
10,221.-012..-000 .82 ACRES
10,111.-079..-000 2.20 ACRES
10,102.-015..-000 .17 ACRES, IMP
10,221.-013..-000 .13 ACRES
10,216.-214..-000 .05 ACRES, IMP
FRENCHCREEK TWP
11,019.-006..-001 MOBILEHOME
IRWIN TWP
12,009.-036..-000 10.00 ACRES

JACKSON TWP

13,006.-002J.-025 MOBILEHOME

13,011.-062..-000 .46 ACRES, IMP

$4,867.93
NO BID

$5,044.20
NO BID

$989.22
NO BID

$4,638.77
NO BID

$5,256.18
NO BID

$3,206.68
NO BID

$5,229.38
NO BID

$4,409.26
NO BID

$512.80
NO BID

$2,199.03
NO BID

$2,790.19
NO BID

$463.28
NO BID

$2,172.96
NO BID

$572.94
NO BID

$1,625.18
SOLD: $1,625.18
KEITH KLINGLER

$809.91
NO BID

$5,038.35
NO BID



SNYDER, LAURIE BERICE

NEELY, ELEANOR

ABPLANALP, ROBERT L &

DOROTHY R

BLACK, ROSE M

BLACK, ROSE MARIE

BRYAN, THOMAS F & TWILA E

BRYAN, TWILAM & E THOMAS F

BUNNELL, LEIGH ANN

CHRISTO, STEPHEN P & KRIS

DEETER, ANTHONY L

GILL, JOSEPH J & IRENE

HALE, LEILA

HARP, MAE G & JUNE L PERRY

HASKINS, RODNEY J

HASKINS, RODNEY J

HOGUE, DANIEL L

JAMES, JASON MICHAEL &
BRANDI NICOLE SIGLER

13,001.-029C.-006 MOBILEHOME
OAKLAND TWP
15,004.-005J.-000 2.98 ACRES
OIL CITY
16,028.-193..-000 .09 ACRES, IMP
16,048.-153..-000 .07 ACRES, IMP
16,017.-206..-000 .10 ACRES, IMP
16,026.-050..-000 .06 ACRES, IMP
16,026.-053..-000 .11 ACRES
16,050.-003..-000 .04 ACRES, IMP
16,040.-267..-000 .14 ACRES, IMP
16,080.-016..-000 .23 ACRES
16,046.-156..-000 .10 ACRES, IMP
16,048.-015..-000 .10 ACRES, IMP
16,038.-212..-000 .11 ACRES, IMP
16,006.-074..-000 .06 ACRES, IMP
16,006.-076..-000 .06 ACRES, IMP
16,010.-248..-000 .07 ACRES, IMP
16,034.-170..-000 .06 ACRES, IMP
.05 ACRES, IMP

JOLLEY, DELBERT LEROY & BETTY L 16,010.-165..-000

$658.75
NO BID

$1,654.83
SOLD: $1,654.83
KEITH KLINGLER

$5,198.51
NO BID

$475.91
NO BID

$517.73
NO BID

$1,692.02
NO BID

$705.61
NO BID

$3,838.43
NO BID

$1,883.49
NO BID

$806.59
NO BID

$4,142.89
NO BID

$2,643.50
NO BID

$1,247.69
NO BID

$5,542.77
NO BID

$4,260.15
NO BID

$9,432.36
NO BID

$1,790.64
NO BID

$4,629.83
NO BID



LEPLEY, WILLIAM C & NELLIE E

LOGSDON, VADIS E

MCGOWAN, KEVIN D

MCLAUGHLIN, RONALD E

MILLER, JOHN K Il &

MARY M MCDONOUGH

OFFICE 1000 INC

PETTITE, WILLIAM C

PETTITE, WILLIAM C

POMPEO, FRANK A &
PAMELA Z CRONKHITE
D/B/A POMPEO PROPERTIES
POMPEO, FRANK A &
PAMELA Z CRONKHITE
D/B/A POMPEO PROPERTIE
RAY, SCOTT A
RETZER, DOROTHY ANTHONY,
TERRY L ANTHONY &
DOUGLAS W RETZER

SCHILLINGER, THEODORE

SHAWGO, JOSH

SHOEMAKER FAMILY PARTNERS OF
MISSISSIPPI LP

GORDON, RUTHANN A

RUST, BILLIEJ

PHILLIPS, DONNA LOU

16,010.-211..-000

16,050.-162..-000

16,010.-309..-000

16,020.-037..-000

CONDEMNED

16,037.-084..-000

16,002.-094..-000

16,026.-199..-000

16,026.-200..-000

16,080.-081..-000

16,080.-083..-000

16,022.-070..-000

16,020.-035..-000

16,008.-220..-000

16,046.-246..-000

16,040.-066..-000

.07 ACRES, IMP

.10 ACRES, IMP

.06 ACRES, IMP

.11 ACRES, IMP

.16 ACRES, IMP

.26 ACRES, IMP

.04 ACRES

.04 ACRES, IMP

.09 ACRES, IMP

.18 ACRES

.13 ACRES, IMP

.10 ACRES, IMP

.06 ACRES, IMP

.10 ACRES, IMP

.16 ACRES, IMP

OILCREEK TWP

17,001.-035..-000

17,001.-033A.-000

26.66 ACRES, IMP

10.61 ACRES, IMP

PLEASANTVILLE BORO

19,008.-035..-000

.80 ACRES, IMP

$2,654.82
NO BID

$487.73
NO BID

$3,628.02
NO BID

$3,307.78
NO BID

$6,840.55
NO BID

$1,766.18
NO BID

$468.81
NO BID

$3,637.85
NO BID

$6,212.78
NO BID

$955.66
NO BID

$6,419.42
NO BID
$4,901.32
NO BID
$1,948.00

NO BID

$2,671.25
NO BID

$4,526.66
NO BID

$4,255.35
NO BID

$4,545.61
NO BID

$2,213.42
NO BID



HOFFMAN, MELINDA S &
KEVIN DONNELL

HARGENRADER, WILLIAM L &
ANGELA K

MILKS, STEVEN T & ROXANNE

BOHR, EDWARD G

DAUGHERTY, JOSEPH W

DAUGHERTY, JOSEPH W

FERTIG, FRANK

SCHIBERL, BRION M & BARBARA

HECKATHORN, WILBERT D &
YELMAJ
HEETER, JOSEPH L & LAVONTA M

MOORE, JOHUN T

HORN, KEN

MAYS, FRED

POLK BORO

21,003.-020..-000 .19 ACRES, IMP

PRESIDENT TWP

22,005.-081..-000 .40 ACRES, IMP

RICHLAND TWP

23,007.-013..-000

ROCKLAND TWP
24,020.-022B.-000 .25 ACRES
24,001B-023..-000 .37 ACRES, IMP
24,001B-026..-000 .37 ACRES
24,015.-015..-001 MOBILEHOME
24,001.-069AK-000 2.37 ACRES

ROUSEVILLE BORO

25,003.-112..-000 .44 ACRES, IMP
25,003.-154..-000 .20 ACRES, IMP
25,003.-113..-000 .46 ACRES, IMP
SANDYCREEK TWP
26,005.-048..-002 MOBILEHOME
26,006.-011..-202 MOBILEHOME

1.03 ACRES, IMP

$8,749.94
NO BID

$12,758.45
NO BID

$2,218.39
SOLD: $2,218.39
PERRY PROPERTIES, INC

$1,114.92
NO BID

$2,409.86
NO BID

$595.11
NO BID

$408.73
NO BID

$664.40

SOLD: $664.40

NEIL E. & CONNIE J.
TODHUNTER

$4,876.04
NO BID

$1,762.63
NO BID

$6,280.20
NO BID

$828.09
NO BID

$363.18
NO BID



MCCLAIN, WILLIAM R & SHIRLEY L  26,016.-022..-000 47 ACRES

JUHI INC

POMPEO, FRANK A &
PAMELA Z CRONKHITE

TURNER, PATRICIAE

SUGARCREEK BORO

28,014.-055..-000 .75 ACRES
28,009.-010..-000 1.02 ACRES
28,011.-229..-000 .09 ACRES, IMP

$832.41

SOLD: $832.41
MICHAEL J. & AMY B.
DREWNOWSKI

$455.50
NO BID

$2,023.75
NO BID

$1,608.94
NO BID



