
PUBLIC AUCTION  

BY VENANGO COUNTY TAX CLAIM BUREAU 

2012 UPSET TAX SALE  

FOR 2010 OR PRIOR TAXES 
SALE DATE: SEPTEMBER 10, 2012 

10:00 A.M. in the Venango County Courthouse Annex, Room 100 
 

LAST UPDATED SEPTEMBER 10, 2012 
 

The properties offered for sale were as follows: OWNER OR REPUTED OWNERS,  PARCEL NUMBER, 

DESCRIPTION, UPSET SALE PRICE. 

 

ALLEGHENY TWP 
 

ESTOK, MARCIE L &   01,001.-074B.-000 5.02 ACRES, IMP   $3,284.15 
 CHRISTOPHER J HANNA SR         SOLD: $3,284.15 

             Keith Klingler 

CANAL TWP 
 

MILLS, DANIEL J & HEIDI A   02,003.-028C.-000 0.70 ACRES, IMP   $8,497.19 
             NO BID 

 

PAYNE, ARLYNN R & CHARLES D  02,005.-026..-000  0.50 ACRES, IMP   $7,948.32 

             NO BID 
 

CORNPLANTER TWP 
 

DUNKLE, DAVID LEE SR   07,013.-021..-000  0.11 ACRES, IMP    $1,767.77 

             NO BID 

 
HORNER, JUDY L &    07,023.-051..-000  1.77 ACRES, IMP    $2,798.64 

 CRYSTAL MUMFORD          NO BID 

 
LAMB, LORA A    07,018.-011..-000  0.50 ACRES, IMP    $805.26 
             NO BID 

 
MINICH, MARY    07,019.-005..-001  MOBILEHOME    $527.52 

             NO BID 

CRANBERRY TWP 
 

GEORGE, HELEN D    08,022.-017..-000  0.97 ACRES, IMP    $4,474.68 
             NO BID 

 
HEPLER, WALLACE D JR & BETTY J  08,045.-025..-000  6.14 ACRES, IMP    $52,783.58 
             NO BID  

 
HEPLER, WALLACE D JR & BETTY JO  08,045.-025..-019  MOBILEHOME    $1,008.32 
             NO BID 

 
O'NEIL, SCOTT M    08,043.-035..-000  0.13 ACRES, IMP    $454.54 

             NO BID 

 
O'NEIL, SCOTT M    08,043.-036..-000  0.11 ACRES    $450.77 
             NO BID 

 
SCHULTZ, MAX    08,043.-044A.-000 0.08 ACRES    $813.08 
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             NO BID 

 
SIMMONS, EMMA D    08,043.-044..-000  0.08 ACRES    $813.08 
             NO BID 
SOCHA, TERENCE J & LOIS J   08,047.-010..-000  0.60 ACRES, IMP    $7,977.62 

             NO BID 

 

FRANKLIN 
 

BARR, CYNTHIA A    10,103.-039..-000  416 4TH ST, 0.05 ACRES, IMP   $3,085.10 
             SOLD: $3085.10 

             Perry   

             Properties, Inc 

 
FIKE, DAVID & STACY    10,212.-013..-000  1235 OTTER ST, 0.05 ACRES, IMP  $4,803.90 
             NO BID 

 
HEFFERN, CHARLES L III   10,338.-021..-000  6 DUBBS ST, 0.25 ACRES, IMP   $2,775.82 
             NO BID 

 
MORRISON, NINA J    10,338.-022..-000  BLEAKLEY AVE, 0.26 ACRES   $467.36 

             NO BID 

 
MORRISON, NINA J    10,338.-023..-000  DUBBS ST, 0.29 ACRES   $474.16 
             NO BID 

 
ROHTLA, RICHARD    10,348.-011..-000  N 13TH ST, 0.90 ACRES   $448.10 
             NO BID 

 
TEAM AUDNEY INVESTMENTS LLC  10,111.-107..-000  1036 ELM ST, 0.14 ACRES  $433.71 

             NO BID 

 
TEAM AUDNEY INVESTMENTS LLC  10,111.-110..-000  628 - 630 HILLSIDE AVE, 0.27 ACRES  $433.71 
             NO BID 

 
TEAM AUDNEY INVESTMENTS LLC  10,111.-111..-00   626 HILLSIDE AVE 0.13 ACRES  $433.71 
             NO BID 

FRENCHCREEK TWP 
 

BAKER, DOUGLAS PAUL   11,001.-023F.-000 4.77 ACRES     $1,320.27 
             SOLD: $2,400.00 

             Keith Klingler 

 

JACKSON TWP 
 

CHATLEY, GEORGE M    13,005.-025A.-000 1.08 ACRES, IMP    $2,813.24 
             SOLD: $3,700.00 

             Michael H. Boocks 

 
DOOLITTLE, SHERWOOD P &   13,003.-041A.-000 0.05 ACRES     $485.54 

 ELIZABETH & JOEY M & VIRGINIA G LIMBO       NO BID 

 

MINERAL TWP 
 

PTASZYNSKI, FRANCIS A,   14,005.-004B.-000 13.53 ACRES     $2,442.70 

 ANTHONY S & ELEANOR D PTASZYNSKI        SOLD: $8,500.00 

             Keith Klingler 
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OIL CITY 
 

BAYVIEW FINANCIAL    16,038.-062..-000   18 PEARL AVE, 0.17 ACRES, IMP  $3,488.42 
 PROPERTY TRUST          NO BID 

 
BEARDSLEY, CHRISTOPHER M &  16,014.-101..-000   1039 W 1ST ST, 0.22 ACRES, IMP  $2700.31 
 KIMBERLY           NO BID 

 
BRUNSON, MARVIN E    16,038.-166..-000   57 PLUMMER ST, 0.15 ACRES   $433.58 
             NO BID 

 
BRUNSON, MARVIN E    16,038.-169..-000   61 PLUMMER ST, 0.17 ACRES   $433.58 

             NO BID 

 
BRUNSON, MARVIN E    16,080.-071..-000   CHARLTON ST, 0.24 ACRES   $433.58 
             NO BID 

 
BUNNELL, LEIGH ANN   16,050.-005..-000   8 MANNING ST, 0.07 ACRES   $560.29 

             NO BID 

 
CHIARAMONTE, ERIC J   16,046.-227..-000   333 EMERALD ST, 0.10 ACRES, IMP  $3,551.58 
             NO BID 

 

DAY, TWILA     16,058.-079..-000   6 CARROLL AVE, 0.05 ACRES, IMP  $3,242.00 
             NO BID 

 
GREER, THOMAS W    16,096.-155..-000   112 GLENVIEW AVE, 0.11 ACRES, IMP  $3,397.77 

             NO BID 

 
GREER, THOMAS W    16,096.-156..-000   GLENVIEW AVE, 0.12 ACRES   $531.89 
             NO BID 

 
HALL, MABEL C    16,050.-131..-000   504 BISSELL AVE, 0.10 ACRES   $561.89 
             NO BID 

 
HARVEY, ROBERT D SR & FRIEDA G  16,022.-174..-000   309 MORAN ST, 0.11 ACRES, IMP  $4,665.13 
             SOLD: $4,665.13 

             Robert E.  

             Richards Jr. 

 
HOGUE, CARL M JR & BARBARA S  16,038.-024..-000   27 PLUMMER ST, 0.18 ACRES, IMP  $2,758.02 
             NO BID 

 
HUTCHINSON FUNERAL HOME  16,040.-250..-000   114 HARRIOTT AVE, 0.17 ACRES  $1,048.81 
             NO BID 

 
JAKUBOWSKI, MARY JO   16,054.-048..-000   501 PLUMMER ST, 0.06 ACRES, IMP  $1,783.33 

             NO BID 

 
KELTZ, JOHN WESLEY    16,020.-038..-000   19 W 5TH ST, 0.11 ACRES, IMP   $3,830.48 

 & PATRICIA DARLENE          NO BID 

 

 
LEHNORTT, MOLLY K    16,042.-052..-000   116 HONE AVE, 0.16 ACRES, IMP  $3,990.42 

             NO BID 

 
LEMA, RICHARD & DAWN   16,042.-158..-000   8 BISHOP AVE, 0.07 ACRES   $590.40 

             SOLD:$590.40 

             Robert Hartle 
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MCCLAIN, JOANN    16,042.-009..-000   CEDAR AVE, 0.04 ACRES   $365.92 

             NO BID 

 
MCCLAIN, JOANN    16,042.-010..-000   115 HONE AVE, 0.12 ACRES, IMP  $1,434.88 
             NO BID 

 
MYERS, NICOLE M &    16,002.-006..-000   5 HAROLD ST, 0.11 ACRES, IMP  $2,125.39  
 WILLIAM A DENNY     CONDEMNED    NO BID 

 
NEERGAARD, CHRISTOPHER A &  16,006.-094..-000   305 WILSON AVE, 0.06 ACRES, IMP  $3,701.02 
 JOYCE E           NO BID 

 
ODELL, DIANE     16,046.-182..-000   EMERALD ST, 0.38 ACRES   $1,419.04 

             NO BID 

 
PERRY, JUNE L & ROBERT E   16,038.-211..-000   83 GROVE AVE, 0.11 ACRES   $715.05 

             NO BID 

 

QUIGLEY, AMY J    16,072.-066..-000   28 HALYDAY ST, 0.13 ACRES, IMP  $4,473.82 
             NO BID 

 
REHBERG, JACQUELINE L   16,096.-148..-000   98 GLENVIEW AVE, 0.12 ACRES  $530.29 

             NO BID 

 
REHBERG, JACQUELINE L   16,096.-149..-000   98 GLENVIEW AVE, 0.11 ACRES, IMP  $2,047.95 

             NO BID 

 
RETZER, DOROTHY ANTHONY,  16,020.-035..-000   13 W 5TH ST, 0.10 ACRES, IMP   $3,445.73 

 TERRY L RETZER & DOUGLAS W RETZER       NO BID 

 
RHODES, HEATHER L    16,038.-235..-000   64 PEARL AVE, 0.17 ACRES   $1,407.13 
             NO BID 

 
ROHTLA, RICHARD    16,017.-041..-000   ALLEGHENY AVE, 0.19 ACRES   $1,194.97 
             NO BID 

 
ROHTLA, RICHARD    16,038.-127..-000   PLUMMER ST, 0.10 ACRES, IMP  $709.10 
             NO BID 

 
ROHTLA, RICHARD    16,046.-213..-000   379 EMERALD ST, 0.26 ACRES   $526.69 
             NO BID 

 
ROHTLA, RICHARD    16,096.-329..-000   RIVER ST, 0.15 ACRES    $549.33 
             NO BID 

 

ROHTLA, RICHARD    16,099.-062..-000   KRAMER AVE, 0.15 ACRES   $794.44 

             NO BID 

 
SHADY, THERESA R    16,040.-175..-000   309 BISSELL AVE, 0.16 ACRES, IMP  $4,394.02 
             NO BID 

 

 
SHARON LYNN ROBINSON  16,034.-056..-000   222 CENTER ST, 0.05 ACRES, IMP  $6,985.53 

LIVING TRUST formerly Robinson, Sharon        NO BID 

 

SHARON LYNN ROBINSON  16,034.-057..-000   224 CENTER ST, 0.06 ACRES   $1,947.20 
LIVING TRUST formerly Robinson, Sharon        NO BID 
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SIMONS, RICHARD H & GRACE M  16,014.-089..-000   106 MAYER ST, 0.10 ACRES, IMP  $3,932.28 
             NO BID 

 

WEST DEVELOPMENT    16,054.-054..-000   25 MANNING ST, 0.17 ACRES, IMP  $5,669.54 
 PROPERTY TRUST     CONDEMNED    NO BID  

                

WU, LAN     16,006.-039..-000   301 E 4TH ST, 0.14 ACRES, IMP   $3,590.48 

             NO BID 

 

OILCREEK TWP 
 

RICHARDS, RICKEY L & BILLY T  17,002.-023C.-000   22.10 ACRES, IMP    $5,257.52 

             NO BID 

 
SEMAJ ENTERPRISES INC &   17,002.-062A.-000   1.00 ACRES, IMP    $10,071.38 
 READING IMPROVEMENT ASSOC        NO BID 

 

PINEGROVE TWP 
 
MORRIS BROS LUMBER COMPANY  18,002.-056B.-000   7.00 ACRES, IMP    $16,333.49 
             NO BID 

PLEASANTVILLE BORO 
 

HANLEY, TAMMY    19,008.-019..-021  MOBILEHOME     $1,814.57 
             NO BID 

PLUM TWP 
 

BIELATA, TIMOTHY J,    20,011.-001..-000   0.15 ACRES, IMP    $1,698.76 

 WILLIAM T BIELATA & JOE BIELATA JR       SOLD: $1,698.76 

             Perry   

             Properties, Inc 

 
HUFNAGEL, PAUL L    20,006.-032H.-000   5.70 ACRES, IMP    $3,408.36 

             SOLD: $6,750.00  

             Keith Klingler 

PRESIDENT TWP 
 

CIALLELLA, ANTHONY   22,002.-038..-718  IMP W/O LAND    $549.06 

             NO BID 
 

HEIDLER, WILSON    22,002.-038..-265  IMP W/O LAND    $478.68 

             NO BID 
 

KRUPA, HENRY J SR    22,013.-034..-524  MOBILEHOME     $505.11 

             NO BID 
 

SNELL, KYLE     22,013.-011..-000   0.37 ACRES     $579.65 
             NO BID 
 

WYGANT, SHAWN    22,002.-038..-577  MOBILEHOME     $808.57 

             NO BID 

RICHLAND TWP 
 

GRIMM, HUGH S    23,007.-016..-000   2.88 ACRES, IMP    $3,263.15 
             NO BID 

 
GRIMM, HUGH S    23,007.-018J.-000   0.46 ACRES, IMP    $1,445.63 
             NO BID 
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ROCKLAND TWP 
 

KUHNS, RICHARD G & SHELLEY E  24,027.-005..-000   0.37 ACRES     $762.41 
             NO BID 

ROUSEVILLE BORO 
 

HITES, ANDREW D    25,003.-095..-000   0.23 ACRES, IMP    $2,189.60 

             NO BID 

 
WEST DEVELOPMENT    25,001.-079..-000   0.23 ACRES, IMP    $6,468.02 
 PROPERTY TRUST          NO BID 

SANDYCREEK TWP 
 

WHEELER, DELBERT B   26,006.-011..-109  MOBILEHOME     $362.90 
             NO BID 

SUGARCREEK BORO 
 

COX, RAYMOND L DBA   28,011.-313..-000   6.50 ACRES     $1,632.71 
 COX LOGGING           NO BID 

 
GRIFFIN, E NELSON & MARY   28,014.-046..-000   2.00 ACRES     $1,143.02 
             SOLD: $1,143.02 

             Keith Klingler 

 
KARNS, LILLIAN M ET AL   28,015.-001..-000   0.50 ACRES     $781.15 
             NO BID 

 
SISKO, BERT T     28,022.-019..-000   0.15 ACRES     $561.31 
             NO BID 

 
SISKO, BERT T     28,022.-034..-000   0.14 ACRES     $553.04 
             SOLD: $553.04 

             Edward N. Conn 

             & Sharon L. Conn 

 
SISKO, BERT T     28,022.-034A.-000   0.03 ACRES     $505.04 
             SOLD: $505.04 

             Edward N. Conn 

             & Sharon L. Conn 

 
SKUBIS, LOUIS ET UX    28,019.-024..-000   1.33 ACRES     $1,231.35 

             SOLD: $2,500.00 

             Michael H. Boocks 

 
SLATER, FRANCIS J    28,012.-150..-000   0.10 ACRES, IMP    $3,217.49 

             NO BID 

 

UTICA BORO 
 

BODIEN, KENNETH L    29,002.-008..-000   0.23 ACRES, IMP    $3,145.75 
             NO BID 

 
BODIEN, KENNETH L    29,002.-011..-000   0.54 ACRES, IMP    $1,409.89 
             NO BID 

 
BODIEN, KENNETH L    29,002.-013..-000   0.09 ACRES     $477.97 

             NO BID 
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VICTORY TWP 
 

DEVORE, ROBERT E    30,004.-008L.-000   2.00 ACRES     $1,143.92 

             SOLD: $2,000.00 

             Keith Klingler 

 


