
 
VENANGO COUNTY TAX CLAIM BUREAU 

2012 JUDICIAL SALE RESULTS 

SALE DATE: MAY 21, 2012 

Venango County Courthouse Annex 
 

 

 

CANAL TWP 
 

BEACH, JAMIE LEE      02,004.-026..-001  MOBILEHOME   

 SOLD:  JOHN W. LAMBERSON     $ 300.00 

  

CHERRYTREE TWP 
 

AMES, ANGELA P      03,004.-005D.-000 .37 ACRES    

 SOLD: GEORGE E. & JOYCE D. REED     $ 600.00 

 

ANTHONY, ELSIE B &     03,010.-007..-000  .29 ACRES,IMP          

     JENNIFER M KINNEAR       NO BID     

             

CLINTONVILLE BORO 
 

FINCH, RUTH A      05,002.-137..-000  .22 ACRES    

 SOLD: JOSEPH CLINTON HANNA     $ 600.00 

  
PRATT, MICHELLE L      05,002.-031..-000  .07 ACRES   

          NO BID 

 

CORNPLANTER TWP 
 

CAMPBELL, HAROLD N & PAULINE L   07,022.-008..-000  1.00 ACRES, IMP   
 SOLD: HARTLAND ACRES, INC     $ 9,000.00 

 
FRY, RICHARD I      07,018.-001..-000  1.00 ACRES, IMP  

          NO BID 

 
HORNER, LARRY R & MYRNA M    07,024.-014..-000  .17 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD: HARTLAND ACRES, INC     $ 3,000.00 

  
HORNER, MYRNA      07,024.-011A.-001 MOBILEHOME   

          NO BID 

  
WILSON, ERIN A      07,015.-014..-000  .92 ACRES, IMP  

          NO BID 

 
YEAGER, JAMES L JR & CHRISTINE A  07,018.-028..-000  .48 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD:  HARTLAND ACRES, INC     $ 2,250.00 
 

 

CRANBERRY TWP 
 

BLAIR, ROY J       08,006.-045..-043  IMP W/O LAND  

          NO BID 

   

RHODES COUNTRY COURT     08,009.-009B.-037 MOBILEHOME  

          NO BID 

   
RHODES COUNTRY COURT     08,009.-009B.-088 MOBILEHOME   
          NO BID 
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CRANBERRY TWP - CONTINUED 
 
ROBINSON, AKEEM & MARK MARKUS II  08,031.-059..-000  .29 ACRES, IMP   

 SOLD: SCOTT V. MOHNKERN      $ 2,750.00 

 
SAENZ, RAUL       08,042.-055..-000  .25 ACRES   

          NO BID 

  
 

EMLENTON BORO 
 

DELAVERN, JAMES F & REGINA F    09,004.-004A.-000 .14 ACRES    
          NO BID 

 

 

FRANKLIN 
 

ALI, SYED I      10,107.-018..-000  743 BUFFALO ST, .13 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD: CONRAD JULIAN DECHANT     $ 12,000.00 

 

BORGER, SHIRLEY D      10,345.-054..-000  OAK HILL, 3.41 ACRES 

 SOLD: KEITH KLINGLER      $ 2,000.00 

   
BURKHARDT, JOSEPH A EST     10,337.-044..-000  ERIE ST, .19 ACRES  

          NO BID 

  
CRAWFORD, BECKY      10,111.-090..-000  1047 ELM ST, .08 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD: STEPHEN C. BEALS      $ 1,250.00 

  
DANIEL, LUELLA      10,109.-001B.-000 10TH ST, .13 ACRES  

          NO BID 

  
EWING, ROY E JR & CHRISTINA    10,222.-008..-000  879 15TH ST, .26 ACRES, IMP 

          NO BID 

  
EWING, ROY E JR & CHRISTINA    10,222.-009..-000  875 15TH ST, .50 ACRES, IMP  
          NO BID 

 

FIKE, DAVID & STACY     10,212.-015..-000  1235 REAR OTTER ST, .02 ACRES 

 SOLD: JAMES L. HARRAH JR.      $ 600.00    

 
HANNA, JOHN L EST      10,337.-003..-000  SPRING ST, .96 ACRES   
          NO BID 

 

HAWKINS, MARTHA      10,109.-001A.-000 10TH ST, .12 ACRES  

          NO BID 

    
HOLLAND, CARY & GRACE M    10,102.-003..-000  523 3RD ST, .21 ACRES, IMP  
 SOLD: WALTER R. DONALDSON     $ 1,800.00 

 

IRVIN, AUDREY & FLORENCE RICHBURG  10,337.-083..-000  313 ERIE ST, .19 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD: LISA M. GREEN      $ 4,000.00 

 

JOHNSTON, MARION E & MARILYN J   10,105.-020..-000  607 BUFFALO ST, .26 ACRES, IMP

 SOLD: JAMES L. HARRAH JR.      $ 11,500.00 

 

KLINGER, WAYNE G & PEARL V    10,337.-019..-000  514 SPRING ST, .08 ACRES  

          NO BID 

 

KLINGER, WAYNE G SR  & PEARL V    10,337.-020..-000  512 SPRING ST, .08 ACRES 

          NO BID 
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FRANKLIN - CONTINUED 
 

MARCH, JOHN      10,337.-018..-000  SPRING ST, .08 ACRES  

          NO BID 

 

MOORE, EFFIE BLEAKLEY     10,338.-028A.-000 DUBBS ST, .24 ACRES   

          NO BID 

 

PORTER, GEORGE W &    10,221.-006..-000  MERCER RD, .04 ACRES       

    RUBY PORTER        NO BID   

 

SUTTON, CALEB      10,339.-028..-000  ERIE ST, .06 ACRES   

          NO BID 

 

WALKER, ETHEL      10,102.-089..-000  BUFFALO ST, .17 ACRES  

          NO BID 

 

  

OAKLAND TWP 
 

DESHONG, ERVIE LEE & MARY LOU LEHNORTT 15,003.-025B.-000 2.00 ACRES   

      SOLD: KEVIN J. FIORE      $ 4,750.00   

  

      

OIL CITY 
 

ADCOCK, ARCHIE A & SHARON M    16,017.-099..-000  218 E 6TH ST, .11 ACRES, IMP  
 SOLD: VENANGO VENTURES, LLC     $ 16,000.00 

 

BEERS, JASON C AND JULIE CRITZER  16,006.-172..-000  108 CHURCH ST, .04 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD: JOSEPH CLINTON HANNA     $ 1,500.00 

 

BORDYNUIK, JOHN INC     16,034.-147..-000  82 SPRUCE ST, .05 ACRES, IMP

          NO BID 

 
BOTROS, BISHOP      16,072.-037..-000  44 HALYDAY ST, .30 ACRES, IMP 
          NO BID 

 

BROWN, NANCY J & SUSAN WEESE    16,026.-055..-000  15 W 8TH ST, .11 ACRES, IMP  
          NO BID 
 

CHANCELLOR REDEVELOPMENT    16,006.-106..-000  15 E 3RD ST, .08 ACRES, IMP    

     NOW – BARAHONA, JOSE        CONDEMNED   

          NO BID 

   
CHANCELLOR REDEVELOPMENT    16,036.-042..-000  128 SPRUCE ST, .13 ACRES  
          NO BID 

 

DASHNER, GLENN C      16,034.-144..-000  88 SPRUCE ST, .08 ACRES, IMP

 SOLD: DANIEL R. TOY      $ 3,500.00  
 

DAVIS, ANTHONY O L & DOROTHY L  16,072.-080..-000  79 HALYDAY ST, .17 ACRES, IMP

          NO BID 

 

DAVIS, DOROTHY L & ANTHONY O    16,072.-051..-000  74 HALYDAY ST, .12 ACRES  
          NO BID 

 

FIKE, RUTH D        16,060.-013..-000  115 E BISSELL AVE, .10 ACRE, IMP

 SOLD: DAVID M. & AMBER A. GUISTE    $ 600.00 

 

GOFORTH, PAMELA      16,042.-186..-000  120 COLBERT AVE, .06 ACRES  

          NO BID 
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  OIL CITY - CONTINUED 
 

HARMAN, DEREK FRANK     16,042.-159..-000  1 E BISSELL AVE, .09 ACRES, IMP 

          NO BID 

 

HICKS, ALVIN      16,017.-111..-000  12 E 6TH ST, .14 ACRES 

          NO BID 

  
HOME SOLUTIONS PARTNERS III REO LLC  16,034.-180..-000  28 CHESTNUT ST, .04 ACRES, IMP

 SOLD: JOSEPH CLINTON HANNA     $ 600.00 

 
LIVANIS, CHRISTOPHER M     16,008.-252..-000  322 & 324  ORCHARD ST,  

          .06 ACRES, IMP  

          NO BID 

 
MANZETTI, GENE W      16,006.-061..-000  312 REAR STATE ST,  

          .05 ACRES, IMP  

          NO BID 

 

MARSH, SAMUEL CLARK & LISA LYNN  16,004.-022..-000  409 E 4TH ST, .11 ACRES, IMP  

          NO BID 

 

MARSH, SAMUEL CLARK & LISA LYNN  16,008.-283..-000  112 W FRONT ST, .31 ACRES, IMP

          NO BID 

  
MOFFETT, THOMAS M & ELIZABETH L.  16,100.-130..-000  806 COLBERT AVE, .13 ACRE, IMP

          NO BID 

 

MORRISON, RUSSELL J & SANDRA L   16,100.-088..-000  171 SIVERLY AVE, .24 ACRES, IMP

          NO BID 

 

OSENIDER, JOSEPH F      16,008.-198..-000  208 W 1
ST

 ST, .22 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD: SCOTT V. MOHNKERN      $ 15,000.00 

 

REX, GREGORY A      16,038.-134..-000  15 CHESTNUT ST, .05 ACRES, IMP 

          NO BID 

 

RUSSELL, MICHAEL A & CHRIS    16,096.-129..-000  26 OAK GROVE ST, .21 ACRE, IMP

          NO BID 

 

SHARP, EDWARD E JR & EDWARD E SHARP, SR. 16,096.-040..-000  62 OAK GROVE ST, .11 ACRE, IMP 

 SOLD: VENANGO VENTURES, LLC     $ 600.00 

 

SHARP, EDWARD E JR & EDWARD E SHARP, SR. 16,020.-094..-000  19 W. FOURTH ST, .10 ACRES IMP

          NO BID 

 

SHARP, EDWARD E JR & EDWARD E SHARP SR 16,042.-165..-000  7 E. BISSELL AVE, .08 ACRES, IMP 

          NO BID 

 

SHARP, EDWARD SR & EDWARD SHARP JR  16,096.-071..-000  101 WILLOW ST, .19 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD: VENANGO VENTURES, LLC     $ 600.00 

 

SNYDER, MICHAEL H & JOYCE R    16,042.-097..-000  7 HOFFMAN AVE, .14 ACRES, IMP

 SOLD: TINA L. GILPIN       $ 5,250.00 

 
TENZA, EDWARD & RAYMOND    16,080.-011..-000  24 UNION ST, .10 ACRES, IMP 

          NO BID 

 

TERRILL, CAROLYN R     16,017.-217..-000  208 HILAND AVE, .07 ACRES, IMP 

          NO BID 
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     OIL CITY - CONTINUED 
 
TUCKER, KARI L      16,014.-053..-000  1010 W 2ND ST, .23 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD: VENANGO VENTURES, LLC     $ 13,500.00 

 
WALKER, AMANDA E      16,038.-290..-000  346 WASHINGTON AVE, 

          .15 ACRES  
          NO BID 

 

WILSON, JAMES R      16,046.-048..-000  209 CLARION ST, .20 ACRES 

          NO BID 

 

 

OILCREEK TWP 
 

LONEY, DONALD G & TINA M   17,004.-016..-000  .75 ACRES, IMP 

 SOLD: WILLIAM R. SCHWARTZMILLER    $ 4,500.00 

 
VERITY TOTLEBENSMITH     17,001.-032..-000  3.40 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD: RICHARD R. MEALS      $ 600.00 
 

 

PLUM TWP 
 

SHATTUCK, CHESTER R     20,002.-003D.-000 1.00 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD: SAMUEL A. THOMAS      $ 2,000.00 

 

PRESIDENT TWP 
 

CLIFFORD, WILLIAM      22,002.-038..-421  IMP W/O LAND  

          NO BID 

   
CUNNINGHAM, KIM      22,002.-038..-603  MOBILEHOME  

 SOLD: JAMES E. MCVAY      $ 300.00 

   
DAUM, DOUG       22,002.-038..-567  IMP W/O LAND  

          NO BID 

   
HARSHBARGER, DAVID     22,002.-038..-312  IMP W/O LAND  

          NO BID 

   
HEITZENRATER, RANDY     22,002.-038..-263  IMP W/O LAND  

          NO BID 

   
SCHEMM, GARY      22,002.-038..-124  IMP W/O LAND  

          NO BID 

 
TAYLOR, DELMAR      22,002.-038..-313  MOBILEHOME  

          NO BID 

    
WAGNER, CHRIS      22,002.-038..-220  MOBILEHOME  

          NO BID 
   

ROCKLAND TWP 
 

KREISHER, GEORGE E JR & BONNIE JEAN  24,023.-002..-000  .36 ACRES, IMP          

 SOLD: WILLIAM R. SCHWARTZMILLER    $ 1,250.00 

            

 

KUHNS, RICHARD G & SHELLEY E    24,027.-006..-000  .42 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD: PATRICIA MCCULLY      $ 7,500.00 
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ROUSEVILLE BORO 
 

KOSTEK, JOHN E & BARBARA M    25,003.-042..-000  .13 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD: TINA L. GILPIN       $ 1,000.00 

  
ZINZ, ALVIN JR      25,001.-086..-000  .18 ACRES, IMP 

          NO BID 

 

     

SANDYCREEK TWP 
 

BURKHARDT, A M & ESTHER A.   26,002.-024..-000  .12 ACRES 

          NO BID 

 

          

SUGARCREEK BORO 
 

DEETER, PHYLLIS M TRUSTEES    28,012.-001..-000  .35 ACRES  

 SOLD: KEITH KLINGLER      $ 600.00 

    

SHANER, WILLIAM A      28,011.-020..-000  .12 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD: MARVIN L. NORCROSS     $ 10,500.00 

  

VALLES, MISAELJEAN     28,010.-009..-000  .17 ACRES  

          NO BID 

 

UTICA BORO 
 

MCLEAN, RANDALL JAY & ERIN MARIE  29,001.-011A.-000 .27 ACRES, IMP   

      SOLD: MICHAEL P. MARSHALL LIVING TRUST   $ 3,500.00 

              

VICTORY TWP 
 

HARTNETT, ROBERT      30,006.-008A.-000 .67 ACRES, IMP  

 SOLD: WILLIAM R. SCHWARTZMILLER    $ 1,500.00 


