VENANGO COUNTY TAX CLAIM BUREAU
2016 JUDICIAL SALE RESULTS
SALE DATE: April 18, 2016
Venango County Courthouse Annex

CITY OF FRANKLIN

KUCA, MIROSLAV 10,220.-041..-000 0.07 ACRES, IMP, 1407 EAGLE ST
SOLD: VENANGO COUNTY LAND BANK $600.00
LINTZ, ALLEN 10,337.-113..-000 0.10 ACRES, IMP, 327 PACIFIC ST
SOLD: VENANGO COUNTY LAND BANK $600.00
PYLE, RANDOLPH C & CAROL L 10,220.-022..-000 0.06 ACRES, IMP, 744 15TH ST
SOLD: VENANGO COUNTY LAND BANK $600.00
CITY OFOIL CITY
ARMBURGER, MICHAEL V 16,042.-167..-000 0.05 ACRES, IMP, 9 E BISSELL AVE,
SOLD: VENANGO COUNTY LAND BANK $600.00
ROUSEVILLE BORO
PUSBACH, WALTER W & ROBIN S 25,004.-012..-000 0.13 ACRES, IMP, 24 HILAND AVE
SOLD: VENANGO COUNTY LAND BANK $600.00
WING, THERESA L 25,004.-003..-000 0.39 ACRES, IMP, 15 HILAND AVE
SOLD: VENANGO COUNTY LAND BANK $600.00
CANAL TWP
PAYNE, ARLYNN R & CHARLES D 02,005.-026..-000 0.50 ACRES, IMP, 568 BUTTERMILK HILL RD
SOLD: SHARLENE COXSON $10,000.00
CHERRYTREE TWP
CARRERA, ANTHONY 03,001.-053C.-001 MOBILEHOME, 223 FIELY LN
NO BID
CORNPLANTER TWP
EDWARDS, EUGENE & MARIA 07,018.-020..-000 0.74 ACRES, IMP, 166 CORNPLANTER HILL RD
NO BID
GOODMAN, JEFFREY A & CATHY L 07,015.-058..-000 0.33 ACRES, ON COLLEGE DR
NO BID
HECKATHORN, ANGELA & JUSTIN 07,011.-085..-033 MOBILEHOME, 68 ROCKWOOD AVE LOT 33
NO BID
SINNAMUTHU, MANONMANI & 07,018.-011..-000 0.50 ACRES, IMP, 128 UNION ST

GUNASEKARAN MUTHIAH NO BID



CRANBERRY TWP

CAPENOS, KATHLEEN C 08,043.-007..-000
CAPENOS, WR 08,043.-008..-000
CAPENOS, WR 08,043.-009..-000
GLASS, RICK JR & DARLA 08,001.-045..-076
HOFFMAN, MERLE E 08,001.-045D.-000

SOLD: SAMUEL R. EAKIN 11

KAHLE, MICHELLE 08,001.-045..-054

KERR, FRANK - NOW BERLIN, FRED C LLC 08,001.-045..-023

KLAWUHN, ROBERT & JUDY 08,001.-045..-042

KOUTNIK, NANCY J 08,042.-008..-000

SOLD: TECUMSEH OUTDOOR ADVERTISING LLC

WALTER, FREDERICK S & CATHERINE A 08,015.-003C.-000
SOLD: JACOB & KATIE SOTTIAUX

ZULETA, GUSTAVO 08,022.-017..-000

CITY OF FRANKLIN

DAWSON, BARBARA 10,337.-083..-000
GUILINGER, BRADEN 10,339.-002..-000
SOLD: DANIEL HALE
SCOTT, JAY ANTHONY 10,215.-037..-000
SOLD: AM CONSULTANTS REALTY LLC
CONDEMNED
THOMPSON, CHRISTOPHER P 10,109.-016..-000
CONDEMNED
WILLIAMS, MARLENE 10,102.-095..-000

SOLD: SAMUEL R. EAKIN 11

WOODBURN, ANNA B 10,341.-006..-000
SOLD: BRIAN KURTICH

JACKSON TWP

DEMPSEY, JOHN 13,006.-002J.-027

0.45 ACRES, 1154 RIVERSIDE DR
NO BID

0.03 ACRES, 1158 RIVERSIDE DR
NO BID

0.42 ACRES, ON RIVERSIDE DR
NO BID

MOBILEHOME, 134 PEAR ST
NO BID

1.00 ACRES, ON BREDINSBURG RD
$ 600.00

MOBILEHOME, 156 APPLE ST
NO BID

MOBILEHOME, 167 CHERRY LANE
NO BID

MOBILEHOME, 115 PLUM DR
NO BID

0.11 ACRES, ON STATE ROUTE 257
$600.00

0.34 ACRES, 173 REX LANE
$600.00

0.97 ACRES, IMP, 2598 BREDINSBURG RD

NO BID

0.19 ACRES, IMP, 313 ERIE ST
NO BID

0.25 ACRES, IMP, 562 PACIFIC ST
$16,500.00

0.07 ACRES, IMP, 1317 FRANKLIN AVE

$2,750.00
0.11 ACRES, IMP, 623 HILLSIDE AVE
NO BID

0.24 ACRES, IMP, 103 BUFFALO ST
$600.00

2.00 ACRES, ON PACIFIC ST
$1,000.00

MOBILEHOME, 173 TITAN LANE LOT 27

NO BID



CITYOFOIL CITY

AMSDELL, JOHN R EST

BITTNER, JERRY LEE

SOLD: FRANCIS DEVIZIA

BOWERSOX, RHONDA M

COPLEY, TIM J & LORI A KINCH

CORPUZ, EDMUND M

DAHLSTROM, GILBERT E

DUMOND, CLAIR & BRENDA

EVANS, FRANKLIN & ROBERT HARKEY

SOLD: FRANCIS DEVIZIA
FLAHERTY, JUDITH L

SOLD: TONYA S. DENNY
FREED, ANDREW T & MARK J

FRESHCORN, DARYL W

KARASINSKI, JASON L & TRACI L

16,049.-167..-000

16,004.-159..-000

16,038.-287..-000

16,046.-186..-000

16,054.-054..-000

16,040.-110..-000

16,006.-045..-000

CONDEMNED

16,042.-010..-000

16,004.-068..-000

16,042.-243..-000

16,002.-051..-000

16,054.-133..-000

SOLD: STOIMEN DIMITROV ANTONOV

KELLEY, RICHARD D & ALICE V

SOLD: ROBERT C. EAKIN

KIRCHNER, ROBERT J

LOCKWOOD, CLIFFORD EUGENE &

DOROTHY B LOCKWOOD

POTTS, ROSE W

ROBERTS, EDWARD S

SABIN, MORRIS D

SIDIBE, YAYA

SINES, JOYEAL A

16,080.-015..-000

16,038.-118..-000

16,072.-073..-000

16,060.-018..-000

16,096.-074..-000

16,048.-021..-000

16,046.-227..-000

16,096.-084..-000

0.12 ACRES, 104 MANNING ST
NO BID

0.10 ACRES, IMP, 805 E SECOND ST
$600.00

0.08 ACRES, IMP, 340 WASHINGTON AVE
NO BID

0.19 ACRES, IMP, 326 EMERALD ST
NO BID

0.17 ACRES, 25 MANNING ST
NO BID

0.16 ACRES, 221 HOFFMAN AVENUE
NO BID

0.05 ACRES, IMP, 209 E 4TH ST
NO BID

0.12 ACRES, IMP, 115 HONE AVE
$600.00

0.07 ACRES, IMP, 811 E THIRD ST
$900.00

0.07 ACRES, IMP, 127 MYLAN ST
NO BID

0.25 ACRES, 1130 RR E SECOND ST
NO BID

0.12 ACRES, IMP, 301 HASSON AVE
$900.00

0.10 ACRES, IMP, 20 UNION ST
$7,000.00

0.04 ACRES, 56 PLUMMER ST
NO BID

0.15 ACRES, 55 HALYDAY ST
NO BID

0.08 ACRES, 123 E BISSELL AVE
NO BID

0.06 ACRES, 116 MARTIN ST
NO BID

0.10 ACRES, 12 - 12 %2 CLARION ST
NO BID

0.10 ACRES, 333 EMERALD ST
NO BID

0.09 ACRES, IMP, 155 WAYNE ST



SOLD: FRANCIS DEVIZIA

SOLTIS, JENNIFER

WESLEY, GERI L

16,038.-106..-000

16,096.-254..-000

SOLD: JEFFREY & ELENITHA BRENAN

WILSON, ANTHONY E & DIANE J
SOLD: FRANCIS DEVIZIA

OILCREEK TWP

TURNER, JEFFREY A

PLEASANTVILLE BORO

ATKINS, RAY U & BETTY JEAN
SOLD: COLONIAL MACHINE CO

CATLIN, ARTHUR B
SOLD: FRANCIS DEVIZIA

FEELY, JASON M & TRINA N ANDREWS
SOLD: TINA GILPIN

HANLEY, TAMMY

PLUM TWP

GATES, BRIAN

POLK BORO

GURAS, DAVID L SR

PRESIDENT TWP

WISE, JENNIFER

RICHLAND TWP

GRIMM, HUGH S

16,096.-097..-000

17,002.-040..-000

19,005.-082..-000

19,007.-024..-000

19,004.-038..-000

19,008.-019..-021

20,002.-047B.-001

21,004.-026..-001

22,003.-007C.-000

23,007.-018J.-000

SOLD: NICHOLAS WILSON & JESSICA WECKERLY

TOMER, JOHN

ROCKLAND TWP

CAMPBELL, WILLIAM B &
HERMAN M RODGERS

23,008.-008..-303

24,001B-020..-000

$600.00

0.10 ACRES, 236 WASHINGTON AVE
NO BID

0.05 ACRES, IMP, 166 1/2 PLUM ALY
$3,750.00

0.17 ACRES, IMP, 91 GLENVIEW AVE
$600.00

0.25 ACRES, IMP, 17256 ENTERPRISE RD
NO BID

0.33 ACRES, ON W STATE ST
$600.00

0.35 ACRES, IMP, 287 S MAIN ST
$600.00

1.34 ACRES, IMP, 391 W STATE ST
$5,250.00

MOBILEHOME, 393 DUNHAM RD
NO BID

MOBILEHOME
365 CHERRYTREE PLUM LINE RD
NO BID

MOBILEHOME, ON MAIN ST
NO BID

MOBILEHOME, 315 MCCREA LANE
NO BID

0.46 ACRES, IMP, 151 AIRPORT RD
$5,000.00

MOBILEHOME
NO BID

0.28 ACRES, ON DAUGHERTY DR
NO BID



CRAWFORD, TOM AND BRANDI 24,001.-014E.-001 MOBILEHOME, 385 TITUS RD

NO BID
SCHOEDEL, MARSHALL P 24,020.-019..-000 1.75 ACRES, IMP, 198 UPPER ST GEORGE RD
SOLD: LEROY COLLINS $35,000.00
YOST, KENNETH EDWARD TRUST 24,020.-016..-000 0.25 ACRES, IMP, 132 ROBIN LN
SOLD: JOHN N. DEMARCO $1,200.00
ROUSEVILLE BORO
GILBERT, RONALD H & KAREN C 25,003.-193..-000 0.18 ACRES, 8 BUCHANAN ST
NO BID
OAKES, TAD 25,003.-178..-000 0.47 ACRES, ON MECHANIC ST
NO BID
ZAHNER, RICHARD W & RUTH F 25,004.-013..-000 0.11 ACRES, ON HILAND AVE
NO BID
SANDYCREEK TWP
ATTLEBERGER, STEPHEN 26,006.-011..-102 MOBILEHOME, 137 OAKWOOD DR
NO BID
GLOVER, PAMELA 26,006.-011..-304 MOBILEHOME, 134 MAPLEWOOD DR
NO BID
GRAHAM, JUSTIN DAVID & LISA N SHAW 26,006.-011..-306 MOBILEHOME, 138 MAPLEWOOD DR
NO BID
KELLY, JOSIAH JAMES 26,006.-011..-504 MOBILEHOME
NO BID
SUGARCREEK BORO
JONES, RICHARD & VIOLA 28,002.-035E.-011 MOBILEHOME, 174 RED BRIDGE LN
NO BID
RAUP, EARL A JR & ROBIN K 28,013.-101..-000 0.09 ACRES, IMP, 504 FOX ST
SOLD: JUSTIN ENGEL $11,000.00
CONDEMNED - NEEDS SEWER LATERAL
SCOTT, JACQUELYNJ 28,013.-051..-000 0.05 ACRES, IMP, 613 EGBERT STREET
SOLD: TINA GILPIN $3,000.00
CONDEMNED - NEEDS SEWER LATERAL
VANDERBARK, MARGARET 28,001.-102..-000 0.02 ACRES, ON US 322
SOLD: TECUMSEH OUTDOOR ADVERTISING LLC $600.00
WOLFGONG, ALLEN H 28,012.-013..-000 0.12 ACRES, ON ROCKY GROVE AVE
NO BID
VICTORY TWP
SCHWARTZMILLER, WILLIAM R 30,006.-008A.-000 0.67 ACRES, 485 TWIN OAKS RD

NO BID



STROUSE, DOUGLAS & LADONNA 30,004.-008GG-000 0.78 ACRES, IMP, 1518 DENNISON RUN RD
SOLD: WILLIAM RIDDLE & TERRI FRYE $5,250.00

STROUSE, DOUGLAS & LADONNA 30,004.-008DD-000 0.76 ACRES, ON DENNISON RUN RD
NO BID



