PUBLIC AUCTION

BY VENANGO COUNTY TAX CLAIM BUREAU

2015 UPSET TAX SALE RESULTS

FOR 2013 OR PRIOR TAXES

SALE DATE: 10:00 A.M., SEPTEMBER 14, 2015

The properties to be sold are as follows: OWNER OR REPUTED OWNERS, PARCEL NUMBER,
DESCRIPTION, UPSET SALE PRICE or NO BID.

MATTOCKS, EDWARD J & JEFFERY P

PAYNE, ARLYNN R & CHARLES D

WALLIS, KURT B

CARRERA, ANTHONY

EDWARDS, EUGENE & MARIA

GOODMAN, JEFFREY A & CATHY L

HECKATHORN, ANGELA & JUSTIN

SINNAMUTHU, MANONMANI &

GUNASEKARAN MUTHIAH

WHITMER, RONALD L SR

CAPENOS, KATHLEEN C

CAPENOS, WR

CAPENOS, WR

EVANS, ROBERT J

CANAL TWP
02,004.-059B.-000

1.30 ACRES

02,005.-026..-000

02,002.-060..-000 3.85 ACRES

CHERRYTREE TWP

03,001.-053C.-001

CORNPLANTER TWP

07,018.-020..-000
07,015.-058..-000 0.33 ACRES

07,011.-085..-033

07,018.-011..-000

07,018.-004B.-000 0.92 ACRES
CRANBERRY TWP

08,043.-007..-000 0.45 ACRES
08,043.-008..-000 0.03 ACRES
08,043.-009..-000 0.42 ACRES

08,039.-009A.-000

0.50 ACRES, IMP

MOBILEHOME

0.74 ACRES, IMP

MOBILEHOME

0.50 ACRES, IMP

1.13 ACRES, IMP

$1,125.69
NO BID

$5,996.08
NO BID

$1,660.74
SOLD: $5750.00
KEITH KLINGLER

$4,100.26
NO BID

$5,489.17
NO BID

$1,193.26
NO BID

$1,482.16
NO BID

$1,863.05
NO BID

$1,157.17
NO BID

$1,573.16
NO BID

$803.82
NO BID

$698.04
NO BID

$3,065.75
NO BID



GLASS, RICK JR & DARLA

HOFFMAN, MERLE E

KAHLE, MICHELLE

KERR, FRANK

KLAWUHN, ROBERT & JUDY

KOUTNIK, NANCY J

WALTER, FREDERICK S & CATHERINE A

ZULETA, GUSTAVO

BAKER, LESTER L & EDITH A

DAWSON, BARBARA

GUILINGER, BRADEN

KUCA, MIROSLAV

LAW, PAUL D

LAWRENCE, BARBARA E

LINTZ, ALLEN

NORTHWEST BANK

PYLE, RANDOLPH C & CAROL L

SCOTT, JAY ANTHONY

SEIPPEL, TUESDAY L

08,001.-045..-076

08,001.-045D.-000

08,001.-045..-054

08,001.-045..-023

08,001.-045..-042

08,042.-008..-000

08,015.-003C.-000

08,022.-017..-000

FRANKLIN

10,214.-038..-000

10,337.-083..-000

10,339.-002..-000

10,220.-041..-000

10,109.-037..-000

10,337.-079..-000

10,337.-113..-000

10,111.-086..-000

10,220.-022..-000

10,215.-037..-000

10,336.-034..-000

MOBILEHOME

1.00 ACRES

MOBILEHOME

MOBILEHOME

MOBILEHOME

0.11 ACRES

0.34 ACRES

0.97 ACRES, IMP

0.27 ACRES

0.19 ACRES, IMP

0.25 ACRES, IMP

0.07 ACRES, IMP

0.17 ACRES, IMP

0.19 ACRES, IMP

0.10 ACRES, IMP

0.06 ACRES

0.06 ACRES, IMP

0.07 ACRES, IMP

0.10 ACRES, IMP

$463.27
NO BID

$1,708.68
NO BID

$574.45
NO BID

$534.98
NO BID

$490.89
NO BID

$650.22
NO BID

$2,633.95
NO BID

$3,040.62
NO BID

$514.75
SOLD: $514.75
CRAIG D. WESTOVER

$3,658.85
NO BID

$3,333.86
NO BID

$5,592.18
NO BID

$4,455.82
NO BID

$2,822.34
NO BID

$5,853.74
NO BID

$1,207.38
NO BID

$4,326.41
NO BID

$6,649.35
NO BID

$3,699.06
NO BID



THOMPSON, CHRISTOPHER P

WILLIAMS, MARLENE

WOODBURN, ANNA B

BERRY, TIMOTHY J & DEBORAH M

DAWSON, EARNEST J & BARBARA A

WILLIAMSON, ROBERT M

BARKLEY, MICHAEL D

DEMPSEY, JOHN

UMSTEAD, SAMUEL D

AMSDELL, JOHN R EST

ARMBURGER, MICHAEL V

BIRCHARD, JAMES F & CAROL L

BITTNER, JERRY LEE

BOWERSOX, RHONDA M

COPLEY, TIMJ & LORI A KINCH

CORPUZ, EDMUND M

10,109.-016..-000

10,102.-095..-000

10,341.-006..-000

0.11 ACRES, IMP

0.24 ACRES, IMP

2.00 ACRES

FRENCHCREEK TWP

11,008.-007..-000

11,008.-006..-000

11,003.-045C.-002

IRWIN TWP

12,003.-025K.-001

JACKSON TWP

13,006.-002J.-027

13,005.-017E.-000

OIL CITY

16,049.-167..-000

16,042.-167..-000

16,028.-113..-000

16,004.-159..-000

16,038.-287..-000

16,046.-186..-000

16,054.-054..-000

0.03 ACRES, IMP

0.63 ACRES, IMP

IMP W/O LAND

MOBILEHOME

MOBILEHOME

1.17 ACRES, IMP

0.12 ACRES

0.05 ACRES, IMP

CONDEMNED

0.16 ACRES, IMP

0.10 ACRES, IMP

0.08 ACRES, IMP

0.19 ACRES, IMP

0.17 ACRES

$1,118.55
NO BID

$3,249.72
NO BID

$1,502.92
NO BID

$1,776.95

SOLD: $1,776.95
BRUCE HILL &
MARY ABBOTT

$2,548.55

SOLD: $7,500.00
BRUCE HILL &
MARY ABBOTT

$458.99
NO BID

$433.88
NO BID

$851.45
NO BID

$2,031.95
NO BID

$785.66
NO BID

$3,200.15
NO BID

$3,738.34
NO BID

$1,180.72
NO BID

$2,875.62
NO BID

$2,847.86
NO BID

$2,107.62
NO BID



DAHLSTROM, GILBERT E

DUMOND, CLAIR & BRENDA

EVANS, FRANKLIN & ROBERT HARKEY

EVANS, ROBERT J Il

FLAHERTY, JUDITH L

FREED, ANDREW T & MARK J

FRESHCORN, DARYL W

GONZALEZ, JUAN J & DAVINA PEEPLES

HUTCHINSON, ADAM J

KARASINSKI, JASON L & TRACI L

KELLEY, RICHARD D & ALICE V

KIRCHNER, ROBERT J

LEWIS, JOEL V

LOCKWOOD, CLIFFORD EUGENE

MAYNARD, CLARENCE L & DOROTHY G

MERRILL, SHARLENE M

POTTS, ROSE W

ROBERTS, EDWARD S

SABIN, MORRIS D

16,040.-110..

16,006.-045..

16,042.-010..

16,042.-121..

16,004.-068..

16,042.-243..

16,002.-051..

16,016.-017..

16,028.-062..

16,054.-133..

16,080.-015..

16,038.-118..

16,042.-132..

16,072.-073..

16,080.-040..

16,022.-155..

16,060.-018..

16,096.-074..

16,048.-021..

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

0.16 ACRES
0.05 ACRES, IMP
CONDEMNED

0.12 ACRES, IMP

0.16 ACRES, IMP

0.07 ACRES, IMP

0.07 ACRES, IMP

0.25 ACRES

0.10 ACRES, IMP

0.08 ACRES, IMP

0.12 ACRES, IMP

0.10 ACRES, IMP

0.04 ACRES

0.43 ACRES, IMP

0.15 ACRES

0.18 ACRES

0.15 ACRES, IMP

0.08 ACRES

0.06 ACRES, IMP

0.10 ACRES

$839.99
NO BID

$2,993.80
NO BID

$2,233.35
NO BID

$2,952.49

SOLD: $2,952.49
WILLIAM COTTER
ESLER

$2,993.72
NO BID

$430.08
NO BID

$657.20
NO BID

$1,615.50
SOLD: $1,615.50
BRANDON R WELLS

$4,353.35
NO BID

$4,963.02
NO BID

$4,951.42
NO BID

$494.83
NO BID

$5,669.57
NO BID

$577.05
NO BID

$548.17
NO BID

$2,689.81
NO BID

$855.56
NO BID

$1,873.95
NO BID

$983.23
NO BID



SHELBY, PHYLLIS M & HARRY W

SIDIBE, YAYA

SINES, JOYEAL A

SOLTIS, JENNIFER

STURGEON, MILES D

WESLEY, GERI L

WILSON, ANTHONY E & DIANE J

TURNER, JEFFREY A

ATKINS, RAY W & BETTY JEAN

CATLIN, ARTHUR B

FEELY, JASON M & TRINA N ANDREWS

HANLEY, TAMMY

GATES, BRIAN

GURAS, DAVID L SR

SALSGIVER, SHIRLEY B & CINDY KAPP

WISE, JENNIFER

16,072.-052..-000

16,046.-227..-000

16,096.-084..-000

16,038.-106..-000

16,050.-160..-000

16,096.-254..-000

16,096.-097..-000

OILCREEK TWP

17,002.-040..-000

0.12 ACRES

0.10 ACRES

0.09 ACRES, IMP

0.10 ACRES, IMP

0.10 ACRES, IMP

0.05 ACRES, IMP

0.17 ACRES, IMP

0.25 ACRES, IMP

PLEASANTVILLE BORO

19,005.-082..-000
19,007.-024..-000
19,004.-038..-000
19,008.-019..-021
PLUM TWP

20,002.-047B.-001

POLK BORO

21,004.-026..-001

PRESIDENT TWP

22,007.-026..-000

22,003.-007C.-000

0.33 ACRES

0.35 ACRES, IMP

1.34 ACRES, IMP

MOBILEHOME

MOBILEHOME

MOBILEHOME

0.71 ACRES

MOBILEHOME

$515.51

SOLD: $515.51
THOMAS T. SHAFER &
JANICE L. LIPPS

$2,475.45
NO BID

$4,444.09
NO BID

$2,937.02
NO BID

$3,150.55
NO BID

$4,189.82
NO BID

$4,865.79
NO BID

$1,739.64
NO BID

$487.71
NO BID

$1,994.59
NO BID

$4,194.90
NO BID

$1,904.25
NO BID

$579.63
NO BID

$524.71
NO BID

$856.49
SOLD: $856.49
ANGELA J. SALSGIVER

$1,004.10
NO BID



RICHLAND TWP

GRIMM, HUGH S 23,007.-018J.-000 0.46 ACRES, IMP $1,486.83
NO BID
TOMER, JOHN 23,008.-008..-303 MOBILEHOME $545.92
NO BID
ROCKLAND TWP
CAMPBELL, WILLIAM B & 24,001B-020..-000 0.28 ACRES $586.39
HERMAN M RODGERS NO BID
CRAWFORD, TOM AND BRANDI 24,001.-014E.-001 MOBILEHOME $507.51
NO BID
ROBINSON, DANIEL & CYNTHIA 24,024.-013..-001 MOBILEHOME $539.52
NO BID
SCHOEDEL, MARSHALL P 24,020.-019..-000 1.75 ACRES, IMP $8,043.96
NO BID
YOST, KENNETH EDWARD TRUST 24,020.-016..-000 0.25 ACRES, IMP $2,669.10
NO BID

ROUSEVILLE BORO

FOSTER, MALCOLM & JOAN 25,004.-004..-000 0.28 ACRES $1,232.93
NO BID
FOSTER, MALCOLM & JOAN 25,004.-005A.-000 0.16 ACRES, IMP $4,598.63
NO BID
GILBERT, RONALD H & KAREN C 25,003.-193..-000 0.18 ACRES $794.56
NO BID
MCCLELLAN, GLENN LJR 25,001.-063..-000 0.17 ACRES, IMP $2,480.66
NO BID
OAKES, TAD 25,003.-178..-000 0.47 ACRES $1,182.62
NO BID
PUSBACH, WALTER W & ROBIN S 25,004.-012..-000 0.13 ACRES, IMP $2,229.96
NO BID
WING, THERESA L 25,004.-003..-000 0.39 ACRES, IMP $3,180.13
NO BID
ZAHNER, RICHARD W & RUTH F 25,004.-013..-000 0.11 ACRES $510.40
NO BID
SANDYCREEK TWP
ATTLEBERGER, STEPHEN 26,006.-011..-102 MOBILEHOME $512.03
NO BID
GLOVER, PAMELA 26,006.-011..-304 MOBILEHOME $559.35

NO BID



GRAHAM, JUSTIN DAVID & LISA N SHAW

KELLY, JOSIAH JAMES

RHOADS, NORMAN S SR

CONTI, JOSEPH R & KATHLEEN M

MAXWELL, MARGARET J &
GLENN MAXWELL

MCCOY, JOHN C & ELLA MAE

HEFFERNAN, JOAN H

JONES, RICHARD & VIOLA

LAAM, DORTHA E

RAUP, EARL A JR & ROBIN K

SCOTT, JACQUELYN J

VANDERBARK, MARGARET

WOLFGONG, ALLEN H

WOLFGONG, ALLEN H

BODIEN, KENNETH L

BODIEN, KENNETH L

26,006.-011..-306

26,006.-011..-504

26,006.-011B.-000

MOBILEHOME

MOBILEHOME

0.53 ACRES, IMP

SCRUBGRASS TWP

27,005.-062C.-000

27,011.-004A.-000

27,005.-058B.-000

1.04 ACRES, IMP

0.79 ACRES, IMP

0.40 ACRES

SUGARCREEK BORO

28,012.-039..-000

28,002.-035E.-011

28,012.-175..-000

28,013.-101..-000

28,013.-051..-000

28,001.-102..-000

28,012.-013..-000

28,012.-013A.-000

UTICA BORO

29,002.-011..-000

29,002.-013..-000

0.14 ACRES, IMP

MOBILEHOME

0.14 ACRES, IMP

0.09 ACRES, IMP

0.05 ACRES, IMP

0.02 ACRES

0.12 ACRES

0.17 ACRES, IMP

0.54 ACRES, IMP

0.09 ACRES

$548.04
NO BID

$556.06
NO BID

$4,669.13
SOLD: $4,669.13
PERRY PROPERTIES

$1,625.13
NO BID

$2,116.08

SOLD: $2,116.08
LEONARD & FELICIA
KNOPP

$557.19
SOLD: $557.19
NANCY E. HOVIS

$4,547.41
NO BID

$485.33
NO BID

$3,252.94
SOLD: $3,252.94
CHAD E. BEACH

$4,460.06
NO BID

$2,181.96
NO BID

$466.42
NO BID

$513.21
NO BID

$3,705.72
NO BID

$1,450.67
NO BID

$412.50
NO BID



SCHWARTZMILLER, WILLIAM R

STROUSE, DOUGLAS & LADONNA

STROUSE, DOUGLAS & LADONNA

VICTORY TWP

30,006.-008A.-000

30,004.-008DD-000

30,004.-008GG-000

0.67 ACRES

0.76 ACRES

0.78 ACRES, IMP

$2,498.16
NO BID

$756.01
NO BID

$6,152.24
NO BID



