VENANGO COUNTY TAX CLAIM BUREAU
2015 JUDICIAL SALE RESULTS
SALE DATE: April 20, 2015
Venango County Courthouse Annex
Conference Room 100 at 10:00 AM

CANAL TWP
DOBRICK, MICHAEL 02,002.-082..-001 MOBILEHOME
NO BID
CHERRYTREE TWP
ANTILL, TIMOTHY & TRACY 03,009.-022..-001 MOBILEHOME
NO BID
SILVIS, STEPHENR 03,012.-010..-000 1.00 ACRES, IMP
SOLD: ROBERT S. VROMAN JR. $ 600.00
CORNPLANTER TWP
GRABBS, LESLIEM 07,018.-012..-000 0.20 ACRES
NO BID
ZAHURSKY, JAMES D 07,018.-015..-000 0.14 ACRES, IMP
NO BID
ZAHURSKY, JAMES D 07,018.-016..-000 0.22 ACRES
NO BID
CRANBERRY TWP
ARMSTRONG, ASHLEY MAIRE 08,043.-014..-000 0.21 ACRES, IMP
SOLD: DAVID F. CLINGER $ 600.00
TEBAY, ROSE M 08,012.-015A.-000 2.19 ACRES, IMP
SOLD: KEITH KLINGLER $ 7,500.00
ZIEGLER, LARRY L 08,043.-012..-000 0.14 ACRES, IMP
NO BID
EMLENTON BORO
MCBRIDE, CHARLES J & STEPHANIE 09,002.-060..-000 0.14 ACRES, IMP

NO BID



BROWN, ISABELLE L

SOLD: RICHARD S. BONAMICO

DEAL, GEORGE A EST

JOHNSTON, CAROLINE M

SOLD: RICHARD S. BONAMICO

KLINGENSMITH, DAKOTA

LINTZ, ALLEN

MOYER, DAVID P

WARNICK, CARINA & JOHN COLEMAN

WISIDAGAMA, DON ANIL SABASTIAN

WOOD, DONALD H SR

WOOD, DONALD H SR
SOLD: RICHARD S. BONAMICO

WALLACE, SCOT C

TROUP, JOHN R

ALEXANDER, DAVID

BAYVIEW FINANCIAL PROPERTY TRUST

BAYVIEW FINANCIAL PROPERTY TRUST

BELL, WILLIAM THOMAS

FRANKLIN

10,216.-151..-000

10,102.-019..-000

10,216.-043..-000

10,111.-089..-000

10,336.-013..-000

10,339.-034..-000

10,221.-025A.-000

10,214.-016..-000

10,108.-030..-000

10,220.-053..-000

IRWIN TWP

12,010.-025..-000

JACKSON TWP

13,006.-002J.-261

OIL CITY

16,096.-021..-000

16,040.-289..-000

16,040.-290..-000

16,006.-134..-000

SOLD: MICHAEL & TAMBRA EISMONT

0.15 ACRES, IMP
$ 600.00

CONDEMNED
0.12 ACRES
NO BID

0.12 ACRES, IMP
$ 600.00

CONDEMNED
0.08 ACRES, IMP
NO BID

0.14 ACRES, IMP
NO BID

0.34 ACRES, IMP
NO BID

0.09 ACRES, IMP
NO BID

0.08 ACRES, IMP
NO BID

CONDEMNED
0.13 ACRES, IMP
NO BID

0.23 ACRES, IMP
$ 600.00

0.64 ACRES, IMP
NO BID

MOBILEHOME
NO BID

0.10 ACRES, IMP
NO BID

0.04 ACRES, IMP
NO BID

0.12 ACRES
NO BID

0.13 ACRES, IMP
$ 600.00



BELL, WILLIAM THOMAS
SOLD: CHRIS ANTONOV

DAUGHERTY, SCOTT D &
FRANCES MCKINLEY OLMES

DEETER, ANTHONY L

DELP, BRENDA S

SOLD: W & SW INVESTMENTS, LLC

DRELICK, ANDREW F

16,006.-135..

16,074.-006..

16,040.-257..

16,116.-013..

16,046.-221..

SOLD: MICHAEL & TAMBRA EISMONT

GRAY, CHARLES M JR & MARY
SOLD: KRISTY MARTINO

HALL, DAVID A
HALL, MABEL C
SOLD: KRISTY MARTINO
HENRY, GILBERT R JR
HOMAN, ERICA
SOLD: MELVIN SCHIBERL

KIBBE, JULIE A

SOLD: WINGS, LLC

LOPEZ, CHRISTINE

MCMUNN, SCOTT J

MCMUNN, SCOTT J

NABA INC

NOVICKI, NANCY K

SOLD: TAMMY L. JOHNSON

OAKES, CLAIRE SR & BETTY M

OAKES, CLAIRE SR & BETTY M

OAKES, CLAIRE & BETTY M

16,020.-093..

16,046.-268..

16,050.-132..

16,022.-131..

16,002.-095..

16,014.-055..

16,048.-092..

16,074.-003..

16,080.-033..

16,096.-101..

16,096.-203..

16,042.-178..

16,042.-173..

16,042.-171..

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

-000

0.13 ACRES
$ 600.00

1.50 ACRES
NO BID

0.12 ACRES, IMP

NO BID

0.57 ACRES, IMP

$11,500.00

0.27 ACRES, IMP

$ 3,750.00

0.10 ACRES
$ 600.00

0.04 ACRES
NO BID

0.10 ACRES, IMP

$1,000.00

0.11 ACRES
NO BID

0.24 ACRES, IMP

$4,000.00

0.08 ACRES, IMP

$ 18,500.00

0.14 ACRES, IMP

NO BID

1.00 ACRES
NO BID

0.29 ACRES
NO BID

0.13 ACRES
NO BID

0.09 ACRES, IMP

$2,500.00

0.07 ACRES, IMP

NO BID

0.09 ACRES, IMP

NO BID

0.09 ACRES
NO BID

CONDEMNED



OAKES, CLAIRESR & BETTY M 16,042.-175..-000
SOLD: MARGARET JOANN RADAKER

RICHAR, CYNTHIA
SOLD: STACIE FIGUEROA

16,022.-171..-000
SHARON LYNN ROBINSON LIVING TRUST 16,034.-056..-000
SOLD: ANNA ANGELOVA BOJILOVA-ANTONOV

SHARON LYNN ROBINSON LIVING TRUST 16,034.-057..-000
SOLD: ANNA ANGELOVA BOJILOVA-ANTONOV

SHARP, BRENDA A 16,037.-088..-000

SMITH, DOROTHY E 16,038.-104..-000

STROMYER, LINNEA A
SOLD: KRISTY MARTINO

16,002.-005..-000
WEAVER, FREDRICK R 16,017.-220..-000
WISIDAGAMA, DON ANIL SEBASTIAN 16,038.-048..-000
WISIDAGAMA, DON ANIL SEBASTIAN 16,038.-178..-000

WOFFORD, JAMES 11 16,040.-181..-000

OILCREEK TWP

ANTHONY, WILLIAM L & LINDA S
SOLD: AFFORDABLE ALTERNATIVE
ENERGY ASSOCIATES LLC

17,002.-083..-000

PLUM TWP

FOX, GERALD & ANNA LOUISE 20,007.-007..-000

PRESIDENT TWP

BANICK, JAMES 22,002.-038..-102

COSTABILE, MIKE 22,011.-038..-000
SOLD: THOMAS ANDERTON & DARREL C. JOLLEY

MUSSER, ROBERT J 22,013.-034..-630

0.11 ACRES
$ 600.00

0.37 ACRES, IMP
$2,250.00

0.05 ACRES,
$ 600.00

MP
0.06 ACRES
$ 600.00

0.08 ACRES,
NO BID

MP
0.07 ACRES
NO BID

0.14 ACRES,
$ 3,000.00

MP

0.08 ACRES,
NO BID

MP

0.15 ACRES,
NO BID

MP
0.17 ACRES
NO BID

0.04 ACRES
NO BID

1.61 ACRES,
$ 10,000.00

MP

0.75 ACRES, IMP
NO BID

MOBILEHOME
NO BID

0.64 ACRES
$3,000.00

MOBILEHOME
NO BID



NESBITT, STEVE 22,013.-034..-605 MOBILEHOME

NO BID
RICHLAND TWP
PRINT, CARRA 23,008.-008..-207 MOBILEHOME
NO BID
SCRUBGRASS TWP
COPENHAVER, CAROL A & WILLIAM D 27,004.-039A.-000 5.00 ACRES, IMP
SOLD: W & SW INVESTMENTS, LLC & WINGS, LLC $32,000.00

SUGARCREEK BORO

FULLER, PAUL E & EMILY R 28,012.-205..-000 0.22 ACRES, IMP
SOLD: TINA L. GILPIN $ 7,000.00

VICTORY TWP

RODGERS, EVELYN 30,007.-001..-000 0.67 ACRES
NO BID

CONDEMNED



